

SMITH BAKKE PORSBORG SCHWEIGERT & ARMSTRONG

Phone Number: 701-258-0630
P.O. Box 460, 122 East Broadway Avenue
Bismarck, ND 58502-0460
Federal Tax I.D. No. 45-0448023

RECEIVED

JUL 05 2011

PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

Illona A. Jeffcoat-Sacco
Public Service Commission
State Capital
Bismarck, ND 58505-0480

July 01, 2011

RE: Northern States Power (PU-10-657) and (PU-11-55)

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
06/01/11 MDA Review and consideration of email from NSP counsel and draft response re: same	0.30	40.50
06/02/11 MDA Draft stipulation for rescheduled hearing and amendment of deadlines; reviewed email from Mike M. and email to Mike M. re: same	1.50	202.50
06/03/11 MDA Review and respond to email from Mike M. re: deficiency in data response; TC w/ Matt Loftus re: stipulation; TC w/ Mike Diller re: update on status of stipulation; TC w/ Mark Gruman; various TCs associated with stipulation and upcoming commission meeting to reschedule; review email from Matt Loftus; revise stipulation; TC w/ Matt L. re: same	1.40	189.00
06/06/11 MDA Follow up re: stipulation; reviewed email from Matt Loftus; executed and filed stipulation; draft letter to ALJ re: stipulation	0.50	67.50
06/09/11 MDA Review and respond to various emails	0.30	40.50

*OK-DAS
6 July 11*

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>
06/13/11 MDA Reviewed letter from Patrick Fahn and enclosed motion; email to NSP counsel re: status of discovery requests and review email from NSP counsel re: same	0.10	13.50
06/15/11 MDA Review amended scheduling order and email to Blue Ridge re: same	0.10	13.50
06/17/11 MDA Reviewed email from Blue Ridge	0.10	13.50
06/20/11 MDA Review and respond to emails from Blue Ridge	0.20	27.00
06/24/11 MDA Reviewed emails from Blue Ridge; teleconference w/ team re: status; TC w/ Matt Loftus re: legal budget DR request	2.50	337.50
06/28/11 MDA TC from Matt Loftus re: attorney fee issue	0.20	27.00
06/30/11 MDA Review email from Blue Ridge and follow up with NSP re: same; review and respond to email from NSP re: same	0.30	40.50

For professional services rendered	7.50	\$1,012.50
------------------------------------	------	------------

Additional charges:

06/17/11 Photocopies		1.84
----------------------	--	------

Total costs		\$1.84
-------------	--	--------

Total amount of this bill		\$1,014.34
---------------------------	--	------------

*OK
7/8/11
7300*

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Mitchell D. Armstrong (MDA) Attorney	7.50	135.00	\$1,012.50